

## BIDS AS READ

**Project Name: Holder-Wright Park Development**

**Engineers Estimate : \$1,947,298.00**

**Bid Opening Date and Time: September 7, 2017 @ 10:00am**

Bidder	Addendum #1 Received (if applicable)	Contract A Bid as Read	Contract B Bid as Read	Contract C Bid as Read	Contract A & B Bid as Read	Contract A & C Bid as Read	Contract B & C Bid as Read	Entire Package Combined (A, B & C) Bid as Read
Thomas & Marker Construction	Yes	\$1,039,000.00	\$190,000.00	\$493,000.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$1,657,000.00
Elford Inc.	Yes	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$1,739,000.00
GLR, Inc.	Yes	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$1,680,133.35
Setterlin Building Company	Yes	No Bid	\$305,000.00	\$679,000.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$965,000.00	\$1,835,000.00
Trucco Construction	Yes	\$1,198,000.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Double Z Construction	Yes	No Bid	\$194,000.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Strawser Paving Company	Yes	\$1,047,463.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$1,233,157.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid

Bid Opened by: Shawn Krawetzki Recorded by: Marja Keplar

Comments: Project will be awarded at the September 25, 2017 Dublin City Council Meeting